
Nutrition for the Skin 
 
We have all been taught how important good nutrition is 
for the health of our body. Your skin benefits from good 
nutrition as well. What we eat or drink can affect the 
condition of our skin - too much alcohol, sugar, salt and 
even caffeine can dull and damage our skin. And what 
we use on our skin - harsh soaps and cleansers, make-
up, chemical treatments, can also have a detrimental 
effect.  
 
What if we could treat our skin with natural products that 
reversed damage, and gave our skin the vital building 
blocks and nutrients so that it could heal, rebuild, 
regenerate, and recover the healthy, glowing skin of our 
youth?  

100% Natural  
 
bel essence is a natural skin care collection with a 
difference. Other skin care companies use "natural" 
ingredients in their products, but they extract elements and 
chemicals from nature and recombine them to create their 
formulas. bel essence combines ingredients just as nature 
herself manufactures them to give your the full benefits of 
each ingredient. 
 
bel essence combines natural and organic oils that are the 
richest sources of vitamins, antioxidants and fatty acids, the 
essential components for healthy, youthful skin. bel 
essence gives you what nature intended and selects and 
combines oils with beneficial properties to maximize your 
results without harmful chemicals and colorings.  Natural 
oils combined to treat and nourish your type of skin giving 
you both instant improvement and long term 
transformation.  


